RFB #: 47-21DEC20- Crushed Stone

Aggregate and Chip Seal Products

Capital Quarries Company

Boone Quarries

Central Stone Company

Inc.

4.8. Base Bid Pricing

Line Description Units by Ton Unit Price/Ton Extended Total Unit Price/Ton Extended Total Unit Price/Ton Extended Total
4.8.1. RSB 3,700 $7.50 $27,750.00 $8.15 $30,155.000
4.8.2. SR1 21,800 $8.50 $185,300.00 $8.60 | $187,480.000
4.8.3. SRL5 19,000 No Bid No Bid $8.60 | $163,400.000
4.8.4. SR2.5 300 No Bid No Bid $8.60 $2,580.000
4.8.5. CRI 36,600 $10.50 | $384,300.00 | $11.47 | $419,802.000
4.8.6. CR2 100 $9.50 $950.00 $10.40 $1,040.000
4.8.7. CR3 100 $9.50 $950.00 $10.40 | $1,040.000
4.8.8. MS 100 No Bid No Bid $6.47 $647.000
4.8.9. QR 500 $7.75 $3,875.00 $9.34 $4,670.000
4.8.10. GQR 100 $11.75 $1,175.00 $12.82 $1,282.000
48.11. | GQR6X9 200 $10.75 $2,150.00 No Bid No Bid




4.8. Base Bid Pricing (continued)
Line Description Units by Ton Unit Price/Ton Extended Total Unit Price/Ton Extended Total Unit Price/Ton Extended Total
48.12. |  GQR6X12 1,200 $11.50 $13,800.00 $12.71 $15,252.000
4.8.13. WR 100 $4.50 $450.00 $4.84 $484.000
4.8.14. GRB 500 $8.00 $4,000.00 $8.72 $4,360.000
4.8.15. 1 Pugged Rock 1,000 No Bid No Bid $0.56 $560.000
48161 S1.25TI 6,000 No Bid No Bid $8.60 $51,600.000
48171 S1.25T2 4,400 No Bid No Bid $8.60 $37,840.00
4.8.18. C1.25 2,000 No Bid No Bid $11.36 $22,720.000
4.8.19. Total $624,700.00 $944,912.000 No Bid
4.9. Chip Seal Pricing:
4.9.1. SC.625 3000 $13.89 | $41,670.00 | $10.00 | $30,000.00
4.9.2. C 375 3000 $13.89 $41,670.00 | NoBid No Bid
4.93. C5 3000 $13.89 $41,670.00 No Bid No Bid
494, Total No Bid $ 125,010.00 $  30,000.00
4.12. Renewal Pricing Increases
Ist Renewal Term 5% 5% 5%
2nd Renewal Term 5% 5% 5%
GRAND TOTAL $  624.700.00 $ 1.069.922.00 $ 30.000.00
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